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COMAL. COUNTY BID 040-2010-105
TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES - POSTS, HARDWARE MARKING

CENTERLINE SUPPLY  CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP. HALL SIGNS IA.H. HARRIS & SONS, INCPATHMARK PRODUCTY
iTEM DESCRIPTION LENGTH [DIAMETER QUANTITY [UNIT PRICE |TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE} UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE |TOTAL PRICE;
POZ - LOC ANCHOR GALVANIZED 27" x 2-7/8" ]0.D. 2-7/8" 800 8.82 7056.00 9.84 7872.00 11.40 9120.00 16.00 12800.00 8.88] 7104.00
WEDGES GALVANIZED 8-1/2" with 9/16" latch hole 800 1.92 1536.00 4.17 3336.00 3.90 3120.00 6.85 5480.00 298] 2384.00
SQUARE SIGN POST GALVANIZED 10' [1-3/4"X1-3/4" 100 14.76 1476.00 16.79 1679.00 24.05 2405.00 27.70 2770.00 16.76] 1676.00
SIGN POST GALVANIZED 12' [0.D. 2-3/8" 800 14.13 11304.00 16.19]  12952.00 24.95| 19960.00 25.55 20440.00 17.51] 14008.00
DELINEATOR POST GALVANIZED 6 with full length drilled holes 500 7.04 3520.00 5.63 2815.00 7.34 3670.00 16.13 8065.00 7.9 3955.00
POST CAP DIE CAST ALUMINUM 5-1/4"sign blade | 2-3/8" 500 4.04 2020.00 4.01 2005.00 3.22 1610.00 10.00 5000.00 3.49 1745.00
CROSS CAPS DIE CAST ALUMINUM 5-1/4" sign bledie | 2-3/8" 500 3.72 1860.00 3.88 1940.00 297 1485.00 10.00 5000.00 3.41 1705.00
UNIVERSAL BRACKET DIE CAST ALUMINUM 500 4.04 2020.00 3.88 1940.00 3.78 1890.00 16.70 8350.00 4.98] 2490.00
EXTRUDED SIGN BRACKET ALUMINUM +"signblade 4 2 318" 800 3.90 3120.00 4.01 3208.00 0.00 10.00 8000.00 1.29{ 1032.00

62.37 33912.00 68.40 37747.00 81.61| 43260.00 138.93 75905.00 67.21{ 36099.00
ALUMINUM BLANKS
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE QUANTITY
STREET NAME BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 6"x 72" 50 8.48 424.00 6.31 315.50 9.01 450.50 11.32 566.00 8.50 425.00
STREET NAME BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 24"x 6" 200 2.83 566.00 243 486.00 2.99 598.00 4.20 840.00 4.10 820.00
STREET NAME BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 30"x 6" 200 3.54 708.00 3.04 608.00 3.75 750.00 5.21 1042.00 5.30 1060.00
DECAL BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 36"x 18" 25 10.81 270.25 9.45 236.25 13.51 337.75 16.99 424.75 11.70 292.50
DECAL BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 18"%18" 100 17.40 1740.00 4.84 484.00 6.79 679.00 8.60 860.00 6.27 627.00
DECAL BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 18" x 24" 100 7.22 722.00 6.31 631.00 8.94 894.00 11.32 1132.00 7.40 740.00
DECAL BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 24" x 48” 50 19.22 961.00 16.70 835.00 23.77 1188.50 30.18 1509.00 20.00 1000.00
DECAL BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 36"x 18" 25 10.81 270.25 9.46 236.50 13.51 337.75 16.99 424.75 11.70 292.50
DECAL BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 30"x 18" 25 9.01 225.25 7.89 197.25 11.10 277.50 14.16 354.00 10.00 250.00
DECAL BLANK RECTANGLE SHAPE 24" x 30" 100 12.02 1202.00 10.44 1044.00 14,72 1472.00 18.80 1880.00 12.98]  1298.00
ADVISORY SIGN BLANK SQUARE / DIAMOND SHAPE 24"x 24" 100 9.61 961.00 8.41 841.00 11.86 1186.00 15.00 1500.00 10.40] 1040.00
ADVISORY SIGN BLANK SQUARE / DIAMOND SHAPE 30" x 30" 50 15.01 750.50 13.05 652.50 18.48 924.00 23.44 1172.00 16.25 812.50
ADVISORY SIGN BLANK SQUARE / DIAMOND SHAPE 36" x 36" 50 27.04 1352.00 18.79 939.50 26.37 1318.50 33.84 1692.00 23.40( 1170.00
153.00 10152.25 117.12 7506.50 164.80f 10413.50 210.05 13396.50 148.00 9827.50
OBJECT MARKERS - HIGH SPECIFIC INTENSITY NON-FLORESCENT PRISMATIC - ASTM D 4956, X
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE COLOR QUANTITY
ALUMINUM REFLECTOR SQUARE 4"x4" YELLOW 1000 NO BID 1.45 1450.00 0.83 830.00 2.40 2400.00 1.69]  1690.00
ALUMINUM REFLECTOR SQUARE 4"x 4" WHITE 1000 NO BID 1.45 1450.00 0.83 830.00 2.40 2400.00 1.69]  1690.00
2.80 2900.00 1.66 1660.00 4.80 4800.00 3.38 3380.00
ITEM DESCRIPTION LENGTH DIAMETER QUANTITY [UNIT PRIC|TOTAL PRICE
TRAFFIC CONTROL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZES QUANTITY
STOP AND SLOW PADDLES PADDLES WITH ALUMINUM HANDLES! 78" with 8' HANDLE 30 NO BID 19.40 582.00{NO BID 42.60 1278.00 75.001 2250.00
WARNING FLAGS ORANGE WARNING FLAGS 24" x 24" ORANGE 100 3.25 325.00 3.12 312.00|NO BID 20.00 2000.00 3.75 375.00
VERTICAL PANELS DOUBLE LEFT/RIGHT PORTABLE 8"x 24" ORANGE/MHITE 50 36.75 1837.50 62.27 3113.50{NO BID 126.66 6333.00 39.50{ 1975.00
FLORESCENT PVC CONES 28" 10lb CONE W/2 REFL.COLLARS 28" TALL ORANGE 100 14.08 1408.00 15.35 1535.00|NO BID 25.66 2566.00 13.49]  1349.00
_ 54.08 3570.5 80.74 4960.5 0 0 172.32 10899 56.74 3699
BARRICADES - SUPER HIGH SPECIFIC INTENSITY NON-FLORESCENT PRISMATIC - ASTM D 4956, TYPE VII, Vill, IX
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE COLOR QUANTITY
TYPE 1 A-FRAME LEGS, PLASTIC 8 AMBER / WHITE 100 59.60 5960.00{NO BID NO BID NO BID 75,00{ 7500.00
A-FRAME FOLDING FOLDING, PLASTIC 24" x 48" AMBER / WHITE 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 75.00f 7500.00
TYPE Nl with 18’ x 24" replaceable rubber base |8’ AMBER / WHITE 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 225.00f 5625.00
59.60 5960.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 375.00} 20625.00
ROLL UP SIGNS, WITH RUBBER BASE
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE COLOR QUANTITY
BE PREPARED TO STOP REFLECTIVE VINYL MESH 48" x 48" CONSTRUCTION 40 110.00 4400.00|236.02 9440.80|NO BID NO BID 115.00f  4600.00
FLAGGER AHEAD (SYMBOL) REFLECTIVE VINYL MESH 48" x 48" CONSTRUCTION 40 110.00 4400.00 236.02 9440.80(NO BID NO BID 115.00{  4600.00
ROAD WORK AHEAD REFLECTIVE VINYL MESH 48" x 48" CONSTRUCTION 40 110.00 4400.00 236.02 9440.80|NO BID NO BID 115.00f 4600.00
MOWERS AHEAD REFLECTIVE VINYL MESH 48" x 48" CONSTRUCTION 40 110.00 4400.00 236.02 9440.80[NO BID NO BID 115.00] 4600.00
FRESH Ol REFLECTIVE VINYL MESH 48" x 48" CONSTRUCTION 40 110.00 4400.00 256.87| 10274.80|NO BID NO BID 115.00]  4600.00
GUARD RAIL DAMAGE AHEAD |REFLECTIVE VINYL MESH 48"x 48" CONSTRUCTION 10 110.00 1100.00 256.87 2568.70|NO BID NO BID 115.00f 1150.00
ONE LANE ROAD REFLECTIVE VINYL MESH 48" x 48" CONSTRUCTION 10 110.00 1100.00 256.87 2568.70|NO BID NO BID 115.00 1150.00
SHOULDER WORK REFLECTIVE VINYL MESH 48" x 48" CONSTRUCTION 10 110.00 1100.00 256.87 2568.70|NO BID NO BID 115.00] 1150.00
X-600 INTERSTATE STAND MUST HOLD 48" SIGN AT HEIGHT OF 7* Meet FHWA, NCHRP-3| 30 117.85 3535.50{NO BID NO BID NO BID 195.00 5850.00
997.85 28835.50 1971.56 55744.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1115.00{ 32300.00




