Midtex Oil Needmore Qil Southwest Synthetics Sun Coast Resources Wright Oil
Estimated Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
ltem #{ Quantity [UOM Description Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price|  Price

£ngine Oil SAE
Grade 5W30, Full Synthetic

1 550|{GL  [55 Gallon Drum Only 14,15} 7782.50 16.20f 8910.00 20.95 11522.50 21.98 12087.9
Acknowledgement of "full
synthetic”. v v v Vi
SAE Grade 15WA40

2 385|GL  [Engine Oil, Full Synthetic 9.02| 3472.70 19.55 7526.75 20.95 8065.75 21.83 8405.7
Acknowledgement of "full .
synthetic”. Not Synthetic \ v v
Automatic Transmission Fluid,

3 440|GL  |Full Synthetic :NO'BID 25.00f 11000.00 30.18 13279.20 21.99 9675.16
Acknowledgement of "full
synthetic". v \ v
Transmission Gear Qil SAE 50

4 SiPAIL |Full synthetic, 5 GL PAIL 141.25 706.25 26.75 668.75 121.38 606.90 113.00 565.00
Acknowledgement of "full
synthetic”. v v \ v
SAE Grade 80W140 OR
75W140 Gear Oil, Full

5 660{GL  [Synthetic 27.05] 17853.00 34.18 22558.80 29.08 19192.80 20.68] 13648.80
Acknowledgement of “full
synthetic", v v v
Automatic Transmission Fluid

6 48|QRT |ATF +4 7.13 342.24 10.20 489.60 3.73 179.04 NO BID
Automatic Transmission Fluid

7 120]QRT |"SP" Reject Al Bids This Line NO BID 7.13 855.60 6.51 781.20 3.22 386.40 NO BID
Automatic Transmission Fluid ]

8 48|QRT {"LV" NO BID 342.24 10.98 527.04 NO BID NO BID
Grease Extreme Duty,
Synthetic Blend,

9 432|78B Multipurpose NLGI #2 5.36] °2315.52 1.18 509.76 7.83 3382.56 NO BID

10 220|GL  |AWGS Tractor QOil 7.33] 7 1612:60 22.00{ 4840.00 19.17 4217.40 6.07
11 “20i6L [Tractoroil NOBID 19.75| 434500 16.17|  3557.40 3.84
AWES, 35 KV, Conductive
Resistant Hydraulic Oil,
12 3|PL 5 GL Pail Only{15 GL) 49.80 149.40 123.75 371.25 141.25 423.75 10.48 31.4
205.18 26270.47 417.12 57602.09 345.12 69473.95 248.60 53845.54 209.92 30787.86



